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SCIENCE AND TECHNOLOGY : 

September 11, 2023 
The Guardian 
Nasa says distant exoplanet could have 
rare water ocean and possible hint of life 
 
 
The space agency’s James Webb telescope 
sent light years away from earth, has 
discovered the existence of a possible rare 
water ocean on an exoplanet, named K2-
18b. The scientific study of the chemical 
composition of the planet’s atmosphere has 
revealed the potential existence of a 
molecule called dimethyl sulfide, that is 
only produced by life on Earth. 

 

 

 

https://www.theguardian.com/science/2023
/sep/11/nasa-planet-ocean-life-james-
webb-telescope 

 

SOCIETY : 

September, 9, 2023 
CNN 
Morocco mourns the consequences of the 
earthquake  
 

Bringing families to spend the night outside 
in fear of further damage, the earthquake 
hit Morocco around 11:11 pm, on the 9th of 
September. The earthquake struck from its 
epicenter, in the High Atlas Mountains, to 
as far as Casablanca with a magnitude of 
6.8. The county is mourning thousands of 
deaths, injured and unaccounted for as well 
as the destruction of some towns and 
beloved monuments. While rescue teams 
are struggling with the research, some 
countries have shown their support with 
aid teams, financial help and medical 
assistance. 

https://edition.cnn.com/middleeast/live-
news/morocco-earthquake-09-09-
2023/index.html 

 

ART AND CULTURE : 

September 15, 2023 
The New York Times 
Fernando Botero, Artist of Whimsical 
Rotundity, is dead at 91 
 

You may not know his name, but you surely 
know his art ! Fernando Botero, a 
Colombian artist with a very particular style 
of painting and sculpting, died last Friday at 
the age of 91. This article comes back on his 
life, the birth of his art style (always 
“round” people) and his way to celebrity. 

 

https://www.nytimes.com/2023/09/15/arts/fer
nando-botero-artist-of-whimsical-rotundity-
is-dead-at-91.html 

 

 

 



 

 

 

SPORT : 

September 8, 2023 

The Guardian 

Rugby world cup kick-off : Paris gears up 

for Olympic dress rehearsal 

 

 “From the Rugby World Cup to the Paris 
Games, here we go for the sporting year of 
the century.” Last week-end started the 
Rugby World Cup that takes place in France, 
awaited by all rugby fans around the world 
(from New Zealand to Argentina, Namibia 
or Japan). A big test for the French 
organizers before the starting of the 2024 
summer Olympic games taking place in 
Paris. 

https://www.theguardian.com/sport/2023/sep

/08/rugby-world-cup-kick-off-paris-gears-up-

for-olympic-dress-rehearsal 

 

ART AND CULTURE : 

September, 6, 2023 

BBC NEWS 

The Rolling Stones confirm details of 

new album Hackney Diamonds 

 

The Rolling Stones have announced their 
first album since 2005, titled "Hackney 
Diamonds," . It will contain 12 tracks and is 
set to be released on October 20. The band 
revealed the album at an event in Hackney 
and features Steve Jordan on drums in 
place of Watts because he unfortunately 
passed away in 2021 from throat cancer. 
The project also includes a song with Lady 
Gaga, and it incorporates an eclectic mix of 
genres. 

https://www.bbc.com/news/entertainme
nt-arts-66720789 

 

 

 

POLITICS : 

September 15, 2023 
BBC News 
Niger revokes diplomatic passports for 
Bazoum-era officials 
 

Emanuel Macron explained that the 
ambassador of France of the Niger was 
sequestered. Protesters wave Russian flags. 
Since President Bazoum was overthrown in 
a military coup on 26 July 2023, the new 
government has asked for the eviction of the 
French troops. Protesters supporting the 
government wave Russian flags. 

 

https://www.bbc.com/news/topics/cvenzmgy

gmgt/niger 

 

 


